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Political Resolution of the  
National Conference of the 

All India Peace and Solidarity Organisation 
 

1. The new global context for peace and solidarity movement  
 
These are very difficult times.  These are also very complex times.  The full impact  of  
the  post-cold war  reality driven by a hegemonistic  inclination  of the sole superpower 
– United States is on blatant display.  The process of economic globalisation  which  
started  during mid-seventies had assumed  great momentum  and  aggressiveness after 
the collapse of Soviet Union and other East European socialist countries.  
 
When  the cold war  was  formally on its way out,  the myth was  spread  that  the peace  
dividend  will now be  available equitably and  universally.  But the  subsequent 
developments  have only  proved  contrary  facts.  Multi-polarity  which should have 
been  a natural  course of  development was  impeded  with a  forceful  and 
interventionist  global regime based on the  exercise of  hegemony; not only  policy 
intervention,  but also  actual  military  incursions  under different flimsy pretexts.  Some 
times,  it was  for  introduction  of  `democracy’ replacing  `authoritarian’ regimes;  at 
times, it was  to  vigorously  and unilaterally pursue  the `war on terror’. `Pre-emptive 
strikes’, `axis of evil’ and `regime change’  have become part of the  every day  lexicon  
that characterises  the present  global context.  In effect,  it is  these  goals  and their  
vigorous  pursuance  that is sought to be  imposed  through  economic,  financial, trade, 
political, ideological  and cultural  processes  on every  conceivable  global  institution.   
 
This new global context and its  proper comprehension  has to be  the basis  on which  
the  peace  and solidarity movement  in India  has to  premise itself.  Since the new 
global reality  infringes  on every  aspect  of  the existence of nations, communities and 
individuals, an effective  movement  cannot  overlook  any of these  ingredients.  Only 
with a holistic approach  which  takes into  account  all these  `bits’ and `pieces’  to 
converge  into a  broad based coalition  of  forces  and  processes, can  the full potential  
of the  movement  be  realised.  Therefore,  in this momentous times  in which  we are  
organising  the conference of the  All India Peace and Solidarity Organisation,  we have 
to  emerge  as a broad-based platform for advancing  peace  which is  a compelling 
precondition for advance.  It is the question of development  and its inseparable linkage  
with  the issue of  peace  that will  have to  hold together the basic  tenets of this  
platform.  It is  in solidarity  with  those who are denied  an equitable access to 
development, which  will constitute  the  bedrock  of our  solidarity movement.   
 
2. The global economic and financial landscape 
 
In understanding the present global and financial landscape, a comprehension  about 
the nature of  globalisation  and its  economic  and financial  outcomes  have become  
absolutely  necessary.   
 
The three decades,  after  the end of the second world war,   had  witnessed  a major  
recovery of the  world economy.  The defeat of fascism and the  stunning success  of  
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liberation struggles  all over – particularly  the countries of  Asia, Africa and Latin 
America  provided a new situation.  The strong presence of the  socialist camp  and the  
increasing  presence  of a counterveiling  Soviet Union made  it impossible  for 
imperialism  and colonialism  to act in the  manner  that they did  during the  period 
between the two world wars.  The policies of  State  intervention within capitalist 
economies  towards demand management,  the requirements of  infrastructure  and  
core sector  development  in the newly-liberated countries  directed  towards  the de-
colonisation  of their economies, technological innovations  all contributed  towards  the 
longest  period of  uninterrupted growth  of the  global  capitalist economy.   
 
But with the  beginning of the seventies, many of these  favourable  factors  started  
disappearing.   High rate of inflation  and  rising  unemployment  was very much  back 
on the  scene.  The formation of the OPEC and the rising global oil prices hit the 
developed capitalist countries, particularly, the US economy. It exposed the soft 
underbelly of these economies.  The response to this emerging  scenario  was  reordering  
of the  economic and financial policy  direction  within  the  developed  capitalist 
economies.  Neo-liberalism  was the response.  The welfarist direction  of the yesteryears  
was  substituted by liberating the market forces – the State going on a withdrawal mode.  
International flow of capital  was directed  to a much greater degree  for short term  
speculative gains.  Global concentration  of capital  increased by leaps and bounds  with  
MNCs prising open  third world markets.  Privatisation was the catch word  for  
transferring  State assets  to  huge  private  monopolies  and  financial  oligarchies at dirt 
cheap  prices.  This also  required  the disabling  of  sovereign  Nation States  and their  
decision-making  autonomy.  The process of  GATT  was fundamentally  re-fashioned  
for  achieving  these goals.  Aided  by the collapse of  Soviet Union and the socialist 
countries of East Europe,  there was  a new  aggressive  edge  to this  offensive  for  
further re-fashioning  of the global economic and  financial  order.  The WTO was born.   
 
The impact of this  new drive towards economic and financial globalisation  based on  
neo-liberalism  started affecting  the third world economies  in the  severest  manner.  
The new largely mobile  international finance capital  was moving  everywhere  with  
great force and intensity forcing policy changes in the third world.  This international 
finance capital had managed to  submerge  their  national differences  and was  sharing  
a degree of  unanimity  in  wreaking a havoc  in these  third world economies.  This 
process  has been at its fiercest  throughout the nineties.  The relative preponderance  of  
speculative  activities  of international finance capital can be  observed from the fact that 
by the turn of the century,  as against  a  $ 65 trillion of global FDI, the  global  financial  
flows  represented by global FII touched $ 400 trillion.   
 
Privatisation, sharp decrease in public investment,  attacks on  subsidies  and other 
welfare measures,  sharp reduction in social sector expenditure – were tell-tale signs  of 
the  undermining  of people’s  right to  livelihood  and  development.  The  price  of  
primary commodities  produced  largely by the  third world  were plunging  while  that  
of  manufactured goods went up describing further international  re-division of labour 
in favour of the richer nations.   
 



 3

Some of the countries  who  emerged with some  strength were  accruing  surpluses  
with the  developed  capitalist  economies – particularly  the United States.  The US 
economy  piled up a huge debt  and  the  global economic and financial  order ensured  
that  it was the  surplus  of  those countries which will  finance  the  deficit  of the  US.   
 
A myth was perpetrated  when  the cold war  was  coming to an end, that  the peace 
dividend  will be  available  to  the  whole world. Large part of the resources which  
were bottled up in the military  expenditure  and the  arms race  will now  get released  
and be  available  as  expenditure for development.  The myth now  stands completely 
shattered. Inequalities  are growing, so is  poverty, hunger, malnutrition  and 
unemployment.  This is evident  through  several reports  produced by world  bodies  
under the  UN system.   
 
There are many other  adverse  ramifications  of  the growingly iniquitous  global  
economic and financial order.  There is an  obsessive  drive towards exercising  control  
over  energy resources which  is seen  at  its worst  in the  continued  blood bath  in Iraq.  
Iran  and rest of  West Asia  is also under threatening  clouds  of this  obsessive  drive.  
The  huge inequalities within  and across  economies  are leading to  consumption 
patterns  and  life styles  in  the  developed countries,  which  threaten a global 
environmental  disaster.  The latest  findings on  climate change  is  a  pointer  to  such  a   
course  of  development.   
 
The forces of peace and solidarity  has to  comprehend  the  dangers inherent  in this  
global  economic and financial  reality.  The victims of this reality are  struggling against  
the  consequences of  each of these processes.  And, that is why  they  are potential  
participants  in the  peace and solidarity movement.  The existing  economic and 
financial situation  makes it  necessary  that the  linkages between  the  prerequisite  of  
peace  and solidarity which characterises the present situation  is  correctly understood.   
 
3. The new global political context 
 
The new global political situation  is characterised  by an  obsessive drive  for securing  a  
unipolar hegemony.  This process  has assumed  a new aggressiveness  after 9/11 
destruction  of  World  Trade Centre.  Global `war on terrorism’ is the  excuse  on which  
the  stratagem  for exercising  control  is being  pursued.  On  issues of  international 
significance,  the United States  is trying to  undermine  the role of the  United Nations.  
Proceeding  either  under the guise of  NATO or  a so-called `coalition of the willing’, it 
is  trying to  re-shape  the international political relationships.   
 
Though in the  aftermath  of the  end  of  cold war,  the  natural  course of  development  
that would be  expected – was the  dissolution of  NATO.  Not only  did it not happen,  
the NATO has  moved  further  East incorporating  Georgia  and Ukraine.  The  NATO’s 
incorporation of not only Eastern Europe but also erstwhile Soviet Republics  bring out  
the  true  intentions  of  US imperialism.   
 
In Asia – South East and Far East -  the superpower  is  obviously  worried about the  
emergence of  China.  The major  aspect  of  the  US foreign policy strategy  in this region  
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flows from  its anxiety  to  contain China.  It wants to  make  Japan and India  a part of 
this strategy.  In the Pacific, the US is trying to  see Australia as its  major partner.   
 
In the Middle-East, Israel  continues  to be the mainstay of  US imperialism’s  foreign 
policy initiatives.  Coupled with this,  the US is also using a few reactionary Arab 
regimes, which is undermining the cohesion of the Arab League and  the effective  
resistance  to Israel’s expansionism.  However,  notwithstanding  these weaknesses, 
Israel is facing growing resistance. Despite  their maximum effort, the Palestinian 
resistance  have not been  extinguished.  The national resistance  in Lebanon  has been 
able to successfully repulse  Israel  despite  facing  the  severest of  attacks.   
 
In Europe, the attempts of  the US  to take  the EU  on board on all issues  and at all 
times, is not proving to be always  successful.  The most significant opposition  from 
Europe – particularly Germany and France  came  during the Iraq issue.  Russia under 
Putin  is also  putting up  a  strong resistance.  The magnitude  of  Russia’s  energy 
resources  are proving  to  be  a major  bulwark  against US unilateralism.  The  Shanghai 
Cooperation Organisation where China and Russia have come together along with  
other  Central  Asian Republics  is proving to be a  major counter weight  in the global 
search for  energy security.  
 
Latin America has been the region  where  the superpower  has suffered  the  maximum  
set-back.   The reverses  that the United States had to suffer in its backyard  was  
stunning. Given the fact that Latin America  was the  biggest laboratory of  US-
sponsored  neo-liberal policy prescription  and the  unquestionable  security  advantage  
that it enjoyed, the Latin American people  had been the biggest victims  of this  new 
situation.  But in Latin America, as the Spanish slogan goes, `people united, can never  
be defeated’.  Cuba  continues to remain a shining beacon.  Starting with Venezuela,  one 
after another, electoral  reverses  were suffered by  US supported rightwing  political 
forces in Bolivia, Nicaragua, Chile, Ecuador and Uruguay . Through an electoral fraud, 
such an eventuality  was  averted  in Mexico.   
 
Rise of terrorism  has been a major feature  of this  new  global  context.  Terrorism has 
been a continuing  phenomenon  in  different  parts of the world starting from the days 
of Klu Klux Klan based on a racial ideology.  In recent times,  this has  assumed  an  
aggressive proportion.  The danger of terrorism  lies in the fact that  it tries to justify 
itself  on the basis of  economic, social, cultural and  denominational factors.  But at the 
same time, it does not  distinguish  between  the  State and  the  citizens  at all.  The 
purported  reason that  it advances  to  justify  the  blood letting  of  innocent citizens  in 
the ultimate analysis  ends up  in undermining democracy.  The attacks on  the World 
Trade towers in New York on 9/11-2001 was the worst ever  incident of terrorism  in 
terms of loss of life.   
 
Having said so, it has to be  also recognised  that  the present US imperialism-driven 
unipolar  situation  is  inflicting  major damages  on  peoples in the different parts of the 
world.  It is in the  failure of the people  to  find  redressal  from  such actions,  that  a 
fertile  ground  for  the rise of  such  forces of terrorism is being prepared.   The response 
of US imperialism in the wake of 9/11 has  not only been  violent and  disproportionate  
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but  also  directed  against people  who had nothing to do with the tragedy.  Last six 
years  have actually shown  that such  responses could not  arrest terrorism but only led 
to its  further spawning.  The present situation in Afghanistan  is a glaring case in point.   
 
In such a background, it has now become eminently more  acceptable  to call for a halt to 
the  present  US-driven `war against terror’ and  while at the same time carrying on  a 
campaign against  terrorism and the fact that  terrorist methods  are completely  
undermining  the  legitimacy of exposing  imperialism’s role in spawning terrorism.     
 
So to sum up the situation, inspite of all its  challenges and complexities,  today, the 
peace and solidarity movement is better placed  to  voice its opposition  to the current  
drive towards  unipolarity and hegemony.  We are  eminently  better placed  to 
articulate  our  concerns  against  the  imperialism-dictated  global  policy regime which  
is giving rise to  greater  inequalities, poverty, joblessness and human  depravities.  A 
more democratic and united  resistance to the present situation is necessary,  with  
widest possible  popular participation,  which, is at the same time  opposed to  forces of 
terrorism and disruption.   
 
4. The New Global Security Scenario 
 
Even a sweeping view  of the  global security scenario will reveal  that  the overall  
unipolar  and  hegemonic tendencies  are  rooted  in  the complete domination  of the  
US in the  present  international  security  scenario.  The hotbeds of  tensions  and flash 
points  threatening peace  occur wherever  this  virtual monopoly over its  control  on 
the  security question  is challenged.   
 
Iraq -  the  security quagmire that  it  represents today, is largely an outcome  of  such a 
tendency.  Similarly,  the global nuclear regime that the  US  is trying to  enforce also  
underline this  unilateralism.  Even though  the  situation  of  Iraq continues  to  worsen  
and has  led to changes within  the  domestic public opinion in the United States, the 
Bush regime’s  insistence  to stay put  is  evident.  And, on top of this,  the nuclear  
confrontation with  Iran is  assuming  a dangerously  aggressive proportion. Till now,  
though  no  clear evidence  has been  established by the  IAEA  to prove  that Iran was  
on the  verge of  manufacturing nuclear arms, the  legitimate  process of  nuclear 
diplomacy within the IAEA framework was  given  a short charge and  the whole issue 
has now been  brought to the  UN Security Council.  Even though  the NPT is  a 
completely  discriminatory  regime,  the right of  NPT signatory nations to pursue  
development of  nuclear  energy programmes for peaceful purposes  are  being  denied.   
The  disinformation  about  Iraq’s  possible  nuclear arsenal  now  stands completely 
shattered.  Similarly,  the dangers of  nuclear  unilateralism  has  also resulted  in the  
explosion  carried out  by  DPR Korea.   
 
In order to  continue with this  unilateral  and  exclusive control over security,  the  
dangerous proposal  of  creating  missile shield has been  revived and is being 
vigorously pursued by the United States.   
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Another pernicious  dimension  of this  obsession  over retaining  control  on security  is 
apparent  in  the area of energy security.  
 
Obviously,  such unilateralism  is increasingly becoming  more unacceptable.   In order 
to  pursue  its  goals,  the US is  advancing  dangerous  concepts  like  the `axis of evil’ 
and strongly pushing for `pre-emptive’ strikes to  bring about `regime change’.  Rather 
than  achieving  its goals,  such a cynical strategy  is actually  giving rise to  a number  of 
flash points.   
 
Unless the whole global  security  order is re-fashioned  with  the  UN and its specialised 
agencies playing a more  meaningful role,  the dangers inherent in the present situation 
cannot be  fought back.   
 
It is in this  context that the  All India Peace and Solidarity Organisation has to champion 
the  cause of  establishing  multilateralism  over  global  security issues.  Dialogue  and 
détente is the  way forward.   
 
5. Iraq – the Central Flash Point 
 
The most dangerous portents of the present  international  situation  is  now being  
played out in Iraq.  Despite running into  its fifth year  of military occupation,  Iraq  
continues  to be in the  throes  of  bloodshed and destruction.  A reputed  United States 
academic  body, the John Hopkins University and its researchers  have established, that 
too about six months back  that 6.5 lakhs of people  have died  in Iraq  since  occupation.  
That the  military occupation  has  led to  untold sufferings  is evident  from reports of  
other  eminent  agencies  on  the exodus  on Iraqis which  have grown to almost  one and 
a half million.  The public  education  and health systems  have collapsed.  The  puppet 
regime  in Iraq  has managed to  hang  Saddam Hussein  in a  classic demonstration of 
`victor’s justice’.  The oil production in Iraq is nowhere near the  pre-occupation levels  
and  the regime is collaborating  to privatise the most  precious  of  Iraqi national assets – 
the oil fields.   
 
But the silver lining in this  bleak  and gloomy  scene in Iraq  is the response of the 
people – the world over.  The real face of  unipolar  hegemony stands exposed,  as never 
before, in Iraq today.  The peace-loving people  and  those who value  human  dignity 
and freedom  have  revolted  and  refused to accept  this  brutality,  lying down. The 
popular mobilisation against occupation in Iraq is unprecedented  in the recent times  
and  as big as  that against  the Vietnam war.   
 
Not only millions have come to the streets, significantly in the West  both  in  North 
America,  as well as,  Western Europe, this popular resistance has also led to  regime 
changes  in  Spain and Italy – the staunchest allies  of Bush’s  war on terror. And  the 
closest of them all - Tony Blair,  faces  an  impending  ignominious  exit.  In Untied 
States itself, last round of elections to both the Senate and  the Congress has  seen  a clear 
mandate against  the  Iraq war.   
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In advancing its goals,  the AIPSO  has to  take upon itself  the task of recognising Iraq as 
the central issue  in its  struggle for peace and solidarity.  The success of  the  resistance  
to  the  imperialist policy  on  Iraq  has to be consolidated.  Unless  the  awareness of the 
people  is  elevated beyond  just opposing  the  policies of the Bush administration and 
establish  that today  Iraq is a tragedy and  is an inevitable  outcome of the  systemic  
factors  that  dominate  the present  international  situation, the full potential of the 
peace movement cannot be realised.   
 
6. Palestine and West Asia – The Resistance Continues   
 
In spite of the  growing assertion  of unipolar  hegemony, since  the 1967 Israeli  military  
adventure, they have  faced the  most  severe setback  in  Lebanon.  The national 
resistance of Lebanon led by the Hezbollah  has been successful in  repulsing  the  Israeli 
attempt to annex  new areas.  Inspite of two months of fierce bombardments on  Beirut 
and other frontline areas, they failed miserably to achieve their military goals.   
 
The war against Lebanon was the outcome of  Israel’s continuous efforts to undermine  
the  functioning of a  free Palestinian state  under  the Palestinian Authority. It was also 
directed towards  securing a frontline against Iran and Syria.  Events also clearly 
established that  all these could not have happened without active abetment  of  the US 
and its allies.  Though  there are  now  differences within the Palestinian resistance but  
there is also  an  evident  search for  unity and reconciliation.   
 
The situation in  the Middle East cannot  improve  and  durable peace  cannot be 
sustained unless  the Palestinian question is  settled  to everybody’s satisfaction.  The All 
India Peace and Solidarity Organisation  needs to  carry on  its  campaign for a just  and 
peaceful  settlement of the  Palestinian  question with  the  right of the  Palestinian 
people  to  have their  independent state.   
 
7. South Asia – Instabilities Within  
 
Important developments  have taken place  in  the South Asian region  in the  recent 
past.  The most significant  of this has been  in Nepal where  popular forces  have been  
able to  deliver  a telling blow  on  the authoritarian  Royal regime.  The King has been 
removed from power and the historic agreement between the Seven Party alliance and 
the Maoists have  paved the way for a constitutional  democracy with a strong  anti-
feudal  content.  Though some  irritants  remain,  the hopes of  the people’s struggle  for 
democracy  to triumph  is appearing to be increasingly more real.  
 
Both in Bangladesh and Sri Lanka, the situation  is very tense.   
 
In Bangladesh,  the growth of fundamentalism  had come to threaten  the very  survival 
of the  political system. The  opposition  had  successfully  battled  the  blatant attempts 
of the Khaleda Zia regime  to  rig the elections. However, presently a caretaker regime is 
in control  which  is clearly backed by the military.  The regime is  avowedly  trying to  
cleanse the  political process of  corruption  and  the scourges of  fundamentalism.  
However,  their clamp down on the activities of political parties  do give rise  to  deep 
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concern  for democracy.  The country is in a state of emergency with  control being  
exercised by those  who are  not  elected representatives of the people.  The AIPSO 
cannot but  raise the  demand for  holding a free and fair elections and the  restoration of  
democracy  at the rule of people’s elected representatives at the earliest.   
 
In Sri Lanka, the situation is extremely  tense.  The atmosphere of confrontation between 
the Sri Lankan government and the  LTTE have reached  dangerous proportions.  The 
process of  dialogue  has completely  collapsed.  The AIPSO will have to  voice  the  
compelling need for   a political solution within the framework of  a united Sri Lanka  
with autonomy for the Tamil people.   
 
In Pakistan, there are  new tensions with the continuation of an armed forces-dominated 
regime led by President Musharraf.  After 9/11, he is also  at times coming in conflict  
with  fundamentalist outfits, but  any durable solution  to the  problems that Pakistan 
faces  will have to be achieved through  expansion of democracy and not  making it  
subservient to the unilateral decisions of the armed forces.  And, at the same time, the  
problems with India  has to be  resolved bilaterally through dialogue.  That  there is no 
way to militarily resolve  these disputes is beyond  any doubt.  Of course, the progress of 
the dialogue process  with India will give rise to  responses  from  fundamentalists  who 
would like to see the process derailed.   
 
Overall,  South Asia constitutes  an important region and the peoples of the  region  are 
ravaged  by  the common problems of poverty, lack of education, unemployment, access 
to development and  of course and  the  violence  thrown up  by fundamentalists  and 
extremist elements.  Therefore,  the AIPSO  has to  strongly articulate the need for a 
strong unity  of the people of the South Asian region and  evolve  SAARC as a  powerful 
instrument for  regional cooperation.  But, the AIPSO cannot  leave  these issues,  that  
will  form the basis of  strengthening the SAARC, to the respective governments.  The 
peoples movement  for peace, development and solidarity  will have to  dictate  the  
SAARC process.   
 
8. Hopes of a multi-polar world 
 
As we have  stated  earlier, emergence of multi-polarity  was supposed to be the  natural 
consequence  of the  collapse of the Cold War and its  associated  bi-polarism.  At least, 
this is  what was claimed by  the imperialist  forces.  But it was obvious  to us  in the 
peace and solidarity movement  that  this was  unlikely to happen.  This was for the 
simple reason that  imperialism,   which is  based on  domination, cannot  relinquish  its 
tendencies  to control  global  processes.  The very  basis  of  international finance capital  
is to  expand  everywhere, making  decisions  and imposing them on  Nation States.  The 
systems that they  tend to  strengthen and reinforce  are based on  greater degree of 
inequalities.   
 
Such inequalities  cannot be  sustained peacefully  and voluntary acceptance  by  the 
people  and  nations  who will  be  victims of  such  a pernicious  course of  development 
is impossible.  Therefore, to sustain  such a  world order,  unilateralism  will  become  
the  course,  which  the  superpower-driven  unipolar world  will try to  impose.  And, 
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that is  what is happening today.  Even  the formal  multilateral processes are being  
undermined.  The United Nation is being subverted. On issues where United Nation is 
not in agreement with the course of action which  the  superpower  seeks to  pursue, the 
UN  is being sidelined.  This is what we saw during military intervention in Iraq.  As in 
politics,  in the  economic  and trade matters similar tendencies  are  on evidence.  
Multilateral bodies  are being  used  to  advance  the interests of  the superpower.  And, 
in the event of any  opposition to fall in line, those  bodies  are being  undermined.  That 
is how  bodies like WTO or  IAEA  are being treated.   
 
But now, strong voices are  being heard  against this  unacceptable situation.  The 
situation has particularly galvanised  after  the  attack  and subsequent  occupation  in 
Iraq.  The huge  popular  mobilisation,  all over,  against the  Iraq policy  of  President 
Bush  (in close collaboration with Prime Minister Blair)  have  created an atmosphere  
where  questions are being  raised.  The tone and tenor are, of course, different.  The  
strength with which  President Chavez  accuses  and exposes the Bush administration  in 
international fora may not be  replicated by the others.  But in February, the  speech by 
President Putin  in an international security conference in Munich is also  a  strong 
indictment  of  unilateralism and violation of  international  laws.  The growing  
proximity of  China and Russia  in the  Shanghai Cooperation Organisation and  now the 
institutionalisation of  Russia-China-India trilateral process are very significant 
developments.  Similarly,  the BRIC (Brazil, Russia, India, China) and IBSA (India, 
Brazil, South Africa) initiatives are important developments.  Again, through the 
initiatives taken by Brazil, India, South Africa and China in the WTO and the G-20 and 
G-99 groupings  leading to the  stalling of the  conclusion of the  Doha round are  
important  indicators of the restlessness against  unilateralism  of  a unipolar world.   
 
It is in  such circumstances that the hopes of a multipolar world  are rising.  But 
ultimately whether  this  can  gather momentum  and lead to  any  ultimate change  in 
the global  power structure  will depend  on  popular processes  influencing  their  
respective national governments. As a force  committed to  peoples’ yearnings for peace 
and solidarity, the AIPSO  will  have to  actively  champion  this  process of  popular 
mobilisation for  achieving  a multipolar world.   
 
9. India is crucial 
 
It is true that  in India, we have  many problems facing the people.  It is also true that  
successive Indian governments  have been  aligning the  national policies  in  keeping 
with  the  globalisation process which  is  decidedly  intensifying  inequalities.  But at the 
same time, India with a big population and  the major  size of its economy,  can play a 
very  important role  in the  struggle against unilateralism and unipolarism.   
 
Unfortunately, during the period of the NDA government,  India had moved away from  
its  traditional  foreign policy  direction  based on  non-alignment  and  independence.  
The foreign policy had drifted towards a more  overt  pro-US position.  The government 
had also  developed  close relations  with Israel.    
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It is  in this backdrop that  the  question of  having an  independent foreign policy came 
up strongly during the elections.  This was more so,  in the process of  evolving the 
National Common Minimum Programme.  However,  after the formation of the 
government,  the  government’s sincerity in advancing an independent foreign policy  
came under  cloud.  The  pro-US drift was  apparent  and the  vigorous  thrust to break 
away from the earlier NDA  legacy  was  conspicuously absent. 
 
This  particularly came to the fore  with  the  exchange  of  visits  between  President 
Bush and the Prime Minister.  The  signing of the  joint defence framework agreement 
with the US  also  revealed  the continuing  drift.  The  possibility of  joint military  
operations  without any specific  UN  role  was agreed to.  This opened up  possibilities 
of  joint  Indo-US patrolling  of Malacca States  which  happens to be the main supply 
line for  China.  The  yielding of the Indian government  on the Iran issue in IAEA  and  
India’s vote in favour of  referring the issue to  UN Security Council   were very 
disturbing.  Similarly,  the  pressures on  India-Pakistan-Iran gas pipeline  was also 
evident.  But the  situation  became  extremely grave  with  clear  political overtones  
which  marked the  implications  of the  joint  nuclear  agreement.   The agreement  had 
serious ramifications on  the strategic autonomy of the Indian government.  This  was 
further compounded by the  new  legislation  which has been  framed by the  US House 
of Representatives and the Senate. The final agreement is now being negotiated.  And, it 
is to be seen whether  the  commitments  given by the Prime Minister to the Indian 
Parliament  in terms of  securing  India’s  autonomy on  strategic issues  and  pursuasion 
of its  independent  nuclear programme  for  peaceful purposes can be  sustained.   
 
While  the government  had  shown  signs of  vacillations  on  pursuing an independent 
foreign policy  and  some  weaknesses  in facing  US pressure, political parties  and 
popular forces  have asserted  against this  tendencies  and  to ensure an independent 
foreign policy.  Some positive developments  have  also  been  ensured.   The 
continuation of the process of  improvement  in  Indo-Chinese relations  and the  
institutionalisation of  Russia-China-India trilateral framework is important.  Among 
these, the  relationship with Russia is also  on the right track.  In the  sphere of  trade and 
commerce,  the  IBSA  process and  the role  that  the country has played during WTO  
negotiations  which led to  formation of the G-20  and G-99 also had  positive  
implications.  These would not have been possible India, Brazil, South Africa and China 
not move with  a close understanding.  Indian  Foreign Minister’s visit to Iran at a time 
when  the US pressure  against  that country is assuming dangerous proportions,  is also  
a positive development.   
 
Notwithstanding the difficulties  over the  question of fundamentalism and terrorism, 
particularly  cross border terrorism, the  positive development and the restoration of the 
dialogue process with Pakistan is also  welcome.  After  certain  initial  flip-flop, the  
approach of the Indian government  towards  the democratic process in Nepal  also 
proved to be a positive  one.  India  with its  commitment to  a democratic system will 
have to play  a stabilising role  in  strengthening  democratic processes  and  facilitating  
political solutions  to eschew violence  and  bring about  stability  in  the South Asian 
neighbourhood. It is  in this direction that the SAARC process will have to be  
strengthened.   
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India with  its size, diversity and its  pluralism and the  democratic structure  can exert a 
huge  influence  in the  region, as well as,  an a global plane.  On issues like  
restructuring of the United Nations towards its democratisation, elimination of nuclear 
blackmail, establishment of  a more  democratic  global relations,  assertion of  the need 
to  subordinate  to  international  laws  towards a more  democratic  economic and 
political global order, an organisation like AIPSO  will have to actively campaign  to 
force the Indian government  to realise  this potential role.  The AIPSO will have to  
cooperate and act in  conjunction with all those political forces,  organisations, groups 
and individuals favourably disposed towards these goals to  ensure this course of 
development.   
 
10. AIPSO  - need  for a new framework of activism :  
Forward to peace and solidarity 
 
The situation today is  fraught with challenges.   But  there are great opportunities.  
Inspite of  the  great tragedy  which  Iraq has come to  symbolise  and the  increased 
aggressiveness  of  US imperialism  as the sole superpower,  widespread and rising 
voice of concern  for peace and solidarity with  victims of  the unacceptable  
blandishment  of  unilateral  assertions is reverberating.   
 
It is in  this  context that  this AIPSO conference  will have to  resolve  to  unite the 
broadest possible sections of peace and democracy loving Indians to voice  our  
opposition  to  this  threat.  For this,  the present  confines of  the AIPSO  has to be  
breached.  We cannot  stay confined  to our  old  self-imposed  limits. There are large 
sections  who remain  untouched  by the  imperatives of  peace and anti-imperialist  
solidarity.  So, shedding all  vestiges of  sectarianism, we have to address these  
challenges.   
 
There are  great opportunities  which can be  realised. Inspite of the challenges,  there is 
also a discernable change in the mood.  We have seen this  in  the  response to the Iraq  
tragedy and many other issues.  We have seen this on  the rejoicing of  the changing  
landscape in Latin America.   
 
The AIPSO  will have to be  more  proactive. It has to vigorously  pursue  this  new 
approach.  The form of our intervention  will have to change  qualitatively  with  greater 
stress on  mobilisation of  people on the streets.  We will  definitely  have  seminars or 
conventions within  closed  rooms or  auditoria  to  analyse  and  improve  our  
comprehension.  We will have to act with clarity.  But eventually, the forces for peace 
and solidarity will have to come out in the open, on the streets.  The role of India  is 
crucial. But the crucial role cannot be left only  to the government. Unless there is  
assertion of the people  it  cannot  shape the course  which  will  influence public  
opinion inside the country.  And, in the ultimate analysis, it is  this public opinion which 
should  force our government  to  play a  more  purposeful role in changing the  global  
reality.  The people have the greatest stake  in the  peace and solidarity. The AIPSO  has 
to  act as a catalyst  in  shaping  that  popular process.   
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Finally,  whether  people  gets interested in this  will depend on our capacity  to  
establish  the  link  between peace with our  rights to  development and,   in its turn, a 
better  life and livelihood.  Because  in  our context, peace does not  mean  only  an 
absence of  physical war  and aggression  but  an appropriate condition for  a 
development  which  improves  our  quality of life.  Forward to a mighty struggle for 
seeking a world marked by greater peace, cooperation and solidarity.  
 


